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I wish I had a paper doll I could call my own… 
 

CONRAD ATKINSON 
As u like it 
 

APRIL 16 – MAY 27  
 

Ronald Feldman Fine Arts will exhibit artworks from the 1970’s to 2016 by Eleanor Antin and Conrad Atkinson.  
Combining political and social concerns with conceptualism, both artists find inspiration in history and the arts and 
letters.   Atkinson sees the artist as a powerful agent for change, and his Northern Ireland series, previously banned, is 
currently on view at the Tate Gallery.  Antin explores constructions of identity, and her archetypal recurrent characters are 
icons in the canon of contemporary art. 

  
CONRAD ATKINSON: On exhibit are several series: Shopping Carts, which conflates high and low culture and featuring 
William Shakespeare’s Shopping Trolley honoring his 400th anniversary year; Aesthetics Can be a Pretty Ugly Business 
incorporating antique paint pallets; and a floor piece of ruby slippers, using the Wizard of Oz as a metaphor for anti-
immigration policies.  Documentary-based works from Atkinson’s first exhibition at Ronald Feldman Fine Arts, Material – 6 
Works (1979), referring to Northern Ireland Troubles, industrial disease, and hunger in the Third World, will also be on 
view.  
 
Lawrence Rinder, director of the Berkeley Museum, has written: It is the forging together of conceptualism and activism to 
art practice that distinguishes Atkinson’s work and makes it such an important contribution to 20th century art history.  
Public collections include the Tate Gallery, the National Portrait Gallery, the British Museum, and the Museum of Modern 
Art.  Atkinson was Distinguished Visiting Professor/Artist in Residence at the Courtauld Institute, London University; 
Honorary Fellow at Cumbria University; and Visiting Professor, Carnegie Mellon University.  He is currently Professor 
Emeritus at University of California at Davis and divides his time between England and the United States.  Atkinson 
received a lifetime achievement award in the UK in 2015. 
 
ELEANOR ANTIN: Some of Antin’s best-known works were done with hand painted paper dolls and puppets in the 
classic little girl manner of creating worlds she can inhabit at will.  The ambiguities of the passive unchanging paper faces 
with the insistent human, melodramatic, Bronx-accented voice are not unlike a threatening storm that only occasionally 
explodes but nobody gets wet.  Featured in this show is Antin’s newest paper doll installation The Theatre of the Absurd 
(2016) with the paper doll cast acting out the current political circus, along with several of her most well-known classic 
video installations, The Adventures of a Nurse (1976) and The Nurse and the Hijackers (1977).  Never before exhibited 
photographs and drawings extend the paper doll analogy. 
 
Eleanor Antin’s solo shows include the Museum of Modern Art, the Whitney Museum of American Art, the Los Angeles 
County Museum of Art, the I.C.A. Boston, and the Miriam and Ira D. Wallach Art Gallery, Columbia University. Her film 
“The Man Without a World” (1991) has been widely distributed.  Public collections include the Whitney Museum of 
American Art, the Museum of Modern Art, Tate Modern, and the Beaubourg.  Her published books include “100 BOOTS” 
and “Conversations with Stalin.”   “An Artist’s Life” by Eleanora Antinova will be published by Hirmerverlag, Munich.  Antin 
has received an honorary doctorate from the School of the Art Institute of Chicago amongst other awards and is Emeritus 
Professor of Visual Arts at the University of California at San Diego.                                                                               

*** 
Press information: http://bit.ly/1UT7KSp 
 

Reception: Saturday, April 16, 6-8.  Gallery hours are Tuesday-Saturday, 10-6.  Monday by appointment.   
For information: Casey Dorobek at (212) 226-3232 or casey@feldmangallery.com.  
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